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Compatibility: Support for all standard versions of MIDI2Synth. Note: The DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl Cracked Version module can
be used for both Midi or System mode users. Supported Controllers: Any MIDI keyboard with a velocity response curve is
supported. The module can be used with any MIDI function, but the following features are currently only supported in system
mode. System Mode: When running in system mode, the output value of each note is dynamically scaled based on the scaled
input velocity. Note velocity is captured from any MIDI function, but only Note On velocity can be scaled. Velocity sensitive
MIDI functions like Pitch Bend, Sustain, or Program Change do not react to input velocity. This feature is not currently
compatible with velocity sensitive parameter banks or effect processors. Data can be saved or loaded with a Save Midi file,
Load Midi file or File menu, or by using the Get Midi file or File->Save Midi File commands in the Editor window. Additional
information: Technical Information: MIDI Input The MIDI input data stream is treated as a MIDI Stream. Because this module
requires only Note On velocity input, it can only process MIDI messages that contain Note On messages. This module handles
"MIDI Stream error" messages (but not channel messages) by passing them through to the next module. MIDI Output The MIDI
output data stream is treated as a MIDI Stream. Because this module processes only Note On velocity, it only produces MIDI
messages with Note On messages. Port Settings The following information can be saved with the module by using the "Save
Port Settings" option from the Module menu. This will allow the module to reload when the module is reopened. •Audio Output
Pins - The MIDI input and output Pins are routed to the appropriate input or output of the Audio I/O module. This will allow a
software implementation of the module to work correctly in either audio mode or in MIDI mode. •Audio Mode - The MIDI
output is routed to the Audio output. •MIDI Input - The MIDI input is routed to the MIDI input. •MIDI Input Setup - The
settings for the MIDI input setup are displayed in the status bar. This should be the setup used during testing. •MIDI Output -
The MIDI output is routed to the MIDI output. The DH_
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Enable or Disable Key Macro Enable: When Key Macro is enabled, the Key Macros are allowed to control the patch
parameters. This function is disabled by default. Disable: When Key Macro is disabled, no Key Macros are allowed to control
the patch parameters. Which Macros Are Enabled: Enable: Select a macros to be enabled Disable: Select a macros to be
disabled Move Up: Move the selected macros up a level. Move Down: Move the selected macros down a level. Apply: Apply the
selected macros to the patch. Reset: Reset the selected macros to their default values. Macro parameters: Num: Number of
Macro Parameters Add Macro: Add a new Macro Parameter Delete Macro: Delete Macro Macro Settings: Macro Name: Name
the Macro Macro Size: How many Macro Parameter's to include Macro Init: What to do when Macro Parameter's are deleted
Macro Renum: The Macro Renumber Value: Which Midi Channel to use for Macro Parameter's Value: Do any other Midi
Channels have to be muted during Macro Operations Graphic Inputs/Outputs: Macro Mute: Toggles the mute state for the
associated MIDI channel. If the mute state is toggled off, the associated MIDI channel is used for data input and output. Macro
Unmute: Toggles the unmute state for the associated MIDI channel. If the mute state is toggled off, the associated MIDI channel
is used for data input and output. Macro Mute: Mute MIDI Channel, toggling the mute state of the associated MIDI channel
Macro Unmute: Unmute MIDI Channel, toggling the mute state of the associated MIDI channel Maximum Velocity Response:
At what input velocity do the values to be output start increasing or decreasing? Velocity Response Curve: With this curve, what
value are you plotting? From what value to what value? Velocity Response Curve: With this curve, what value are you plotting?
From what value to what value? Status Bar: The Status Bar on the right side of the Graph shows the following information.
Number of Macro Parameters: The number of Macro Parameters found in the current patch. Number of Macro Parameters:
The number of Macro Parameters found in the current patch. Enabling and Disabling the Keyboard Input of the current
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This module is an extension to the MidiOsc module. It provides a graphical user interface for setting the velocity response curve
for the MidiOut osc. The velocity response is represented by a 128 x 128 grid. The top left corner shows the input velocity and
the bottom right corner shows the output velocity. The horizontal axis represents the input velocity (0 - 127) and the vertical axis
represents the output velocity (0 - 127). The input can be toggled between the Fixed Point and Decimal Inputs. Velocity of each
node can be toggled on or off. You can choose to display the High and Low Velocity Offsets along with the Velocity Response
of each node. High and Low Velocity Offsets are added to the input and output velocity to show the range over which the
velocity of the input will be raised or lowered relative to the input velocity. These offsets are usually in tenths of cents and can
be set to any value. The exact value of the offsets can be configured by double-clicking on the first node in the Velocity
Response grid. The node where the input velocity is set can be toggled to show only the original input velocity or the input
velocity + the High and Low Velocity Offsets. Once configured, the values of the offsets can be saved as part of a patch or
exported to a MIDI file. MidiOut: A 128 x 128 grid with nodes representing each node in the Velocity Response grid of the
DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl module. Click on a node to open a new module that lets you set any of the following parameters: Node
Value - Sets the input and output velocities of the node as described in the Velocity Response grid of the DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl
module. The node's value can be set in any convenient format such as Decimal Points, MIDI Pitch Bend Range or percent. The
exact value of the node's value can be configured by double-clicking on the node. Resolution - Sets the value of each node in the
Velocity Response grid of the DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl module. This is an optional parameter that allows the velocity response to
be made more precise by adding nodes with higher resolution. High and Low Velocity Offsets - This module provides additional
access to parameters that are set in the Velocity Response grid of the DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl module. These parameters include
High and Low Velocity Offsets, which are added to the input and output

What's New In?

This module uses the DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl class to process MIDI data. It can generate an output MIDI stream, using any
velocity curve that the user defines. The input is a MIDI In stream from the MIDI keyboard. It can be directly connected to a
MIDI out port on the sound card, or it can be routed to a MIDI Out port in an external control pak. The selected MIDI track
must have a MIDI Out control port connected to an external MIDI synth or sequencer. This class provides a link to the
DH_GainCtrl class. If a user chooses to use a gain curve, then the gain control must be present in the patch. The classes are
designed to work together in a parallel, connected setup. Note: You cannot use both the DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl and the
DH_MIDIGainCtrl in the same patch. The DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl will not create a MIDI output stream if the
DH_MIDIGainCtrl has not defined a gain control. You can configure the DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl to accept any MIDI channel
number and use it to generate any number of MIDI channels. You can use this function to manipulate the range of input MIDI
data that is processed by this module. The standard configuration expects to be connected to a MIDI Out port on the sound card.
If you are not connected to a sound card, or to a MIDI Out port on a control port, or to any MIDI channel, the
DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl automatically disables itself. Inputs: MIDI In - MIDI input stream from MIDI keyboard Outputs: MIDI
Out - MIDI input stream with Note On velocities scaled according to the user-defined velocity response graph. Bkgnd RGB,
Text RGB, Line RGB - Background, text and line colors for the graphic window, as composite RGB integer values. The
DH_TextToRGB and DH_ColorPicker modules in the DH_Sub-ControlPak are recommended as handy tools for setting these
colors. The modules are free for unlimited use within the SynthEdit environment. Graphic Window: The grid initially appears
with a diagonal line that represents a linear response: the output velocity = the input velocity at all levels. You adjust the
response by adding nodes to the line. Add a node by double-clicking on any point. You can add as many nodes as you need to
create the response curve you want. Nodes can be dragged above the diagonal line to make the output velocity higher at a given
horizontal input velocity, or below the diagonal line to make the output velocity less than the input velocity. The input and
output values are shown in the upper left corner as you drag a node. To delete a node, click on it while pressing the Ctrl key
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System Requirements For DH_MIDIVelocityCtrl:

* Windows XP or later * DirectX 9 compatible video card (with Shader Model 3.0) * At least a Pentium III processor (200MHz
recommended) * The minimum recommended display is 1024 x 768 pixel resolution * 1.5GB of free hard drive space * 256MB
of RAM recommended * Windows ME or 2000 compatible sound card * UAC is recommended. * Windows Vista or later *
DirectX 10 compatible video card (with Shader Model 3.0) * At least
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